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The recent panic in the financial markets and the lack of consumer confidence that has led to a 
significant downturn in the overall national and global economies has also taken a toll on 
recycling. Markets for traditional recyclables (paper, plastics and metals) nose-dived this fall, 
mostly over a six-week time span. Newspaper went from $130 in October ‘08 to $30 in December 
‘08. Milk jugs were paying close to $900/ton in September ‘08 and appear to have recently 
leveled off at $260 per ton (a 346% drop). Cardboard has gone from a high of $140/ton in March 
‘08 to $25 in December ‘08. 

Recent articles have appeared in the press about the poor market conditions and freefalling 
prices being paid for recyclables. Some of these articles have highlighted people who question 
the cost of recycling and suggest that municipalities and others should abandon their recycling 
programs. Our advice…don’t panic and don’t abandon your recycling programs! 

As a few articles have pointed out, recyclable markets have been down before and have always 
returned to new highs. The past decade or so has seen continually increasing prices paid for 
recyclables as well as many new people and businesses entering the field of recycling. These 
new “players” have not witnessed the cyclical nature of recycling markets that those of us who 
have been in the business for several decades have observed. Before the growth in the value of 
recyclables seen during the last decade, there were frequent times when prices were low and 
municipalities and businesses had difficulty getting anyone to take their products, let alone pay for 
them.  

As the graph accompanying this article shows, the amount paid for cardboard has fluctuated 
dramatically over the past 15 years. The average price paid for baled cardboard between 1994 
and 2009 was $74/ton. 

Recycling makes sense, even in these tenuous market conditions. It decreases consumption of 
natural resources and energy, creates less pollution, and provides a cost savings over disposal 
even in poor markets. For all of these reasons, Maine public and private sector organizations 
have been investing in recycling infrastructure for more than three decades. Keeping recycling 
programs active makes the best use of this infrastructure and supports the educational effort that 
has gone into encouraging the public to recycle. That way, when prices rebound, municipalities 
will be prepared to not only recycle for these reasons, but also “profit” from the improved prices.  

A review of a few key points in recycling may be helpful. 

• Recyclables - newsprint, corrugated cardboard, office paper, mixed paper, plastics, scrap iron 
and various metals, to name a few - are essentially raw materials that are used in various 
manufacturing processes. They are used to make new products similar to their original form. For 
example, used cardboard is made into new boxes at various mills in Eastern Canada and the 
United States. Linerboard (the outside of the box) and medium (the inside of the box) are both 
made from paper generated in Maine. Huhtamaki Food Service makes drink trays in Waterville. 
Katahdin Paper produces paper in East Millinocket used in telephone directories. Plastic milk jugs 
and detergent bottles are used in Pennsylvania to manufacture such items as Tyvek envelopes 
and motor oil containers, and scrap metal is used for new appliances, car parts, and rebar for 
concrete.  



zoom in

• When the economy is good, manufacturing increases. All raw materials, including recyclables 
that are a direct substitute for raw materials obtained from nature (remember that fact), are in 
high demand when the economy is good and manufacturing plants are humming along, whether 
those plants are here or overseas. Prices are high. But when consumer demand slows down and 
manufacturers have to cut back or close their factories, demand (and price paid) for the raw 
materials obviously decreases. Take the price paid for milk jugs and other plastic containers; 
these prices are directly affected by the manufacturing cost of making virgin plastics, a process 
that mostly uses natural gas. Natural gas prices have fallen and so have recycled plastic prices. 
Hence, the price of recyclables mirrors the prices of other commodities. If readers have been 
following the economic trends, they know that over the past year, commodity prices reached all 
time highs (a bubble in economic lingo). Commodity prices fell rapidly this fall as a result of the 
worldwide economic downturn. The value of recyclables was not exempt from this downturn in 
commodity prices.  

• Recycling has many advantages over throwing all of these “raw materials” into the solid waste 
stream for incineration or landfilling. It saves valuable natural resources – the raw materials that 
recyclables replace. Recycling generally saves energy, thereby further conserving resources and 
reducing greenhouse gases. Recycling conserves valuable landfill space. Recycling reduces solid 
waste quantities and therefore tipping fees for trash to be burned or buried.  

• Manufacturers use various natural resources whether they are petroleum (for plastics), iron ore 
(for steel), or trees (for paper) to make the products that we buy every day and the packaging that 
they come in. Some of the things we buy, cereal boxes for instance, are made from paper that we 
recycled last month. We buy a newspaper today, read it and recycle it and next month part of it 
may appear in a drink tray that we get at McDonald’s. These products and packaging eventually 
end up as unwanted items but they have value. Recycling those items provides a substitute for 
the raw materials. Conservation of the earth’s resources is becoming a higher priority as concern 
grows over the availability of these resources for future generations. 

• Research has shown that recycling products saves both energy and in most cases water 
consumption. Reducing energy consumption is an increasingly important goal in order to reduce 
our dependence on petroleum fuels and to reduce greenhouse gas emissions and help control 
global warming. Reducing water consumption for manufacturing means that water will be 
available for drinking, wildlife habitat and agricultural production. It also means less water 
pollution.  

• In response to the public outcry at the development of new solid waste landfills in the late 
1980s, Maine adopted a solid waste hierarchy encouraging reduction, reuse and recycling over 
incineration and landfilling. Recycling reduces our dependence on costly disposal processes, 
reduces the need for new landfills and incinerators, and reduces the potential for environmental 
harm from these facilities.  
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• Over the years, people in the solid waste field have considered recycling as a positive 
investment, not because of high prices paid for the recyclables but because recycling is a viable 
economic alternative to landfill disposal and incineration. 

Victor Horton and John Albertini work for the Maine Resource Recovery Association. 
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